

PUBLIC INTEREST ADVOCACY CENTRE LE CENTRE POUR LA DÉFENSE DE L'INTÉRÊT PUBLIC

ONE Nicholas Street, Suite 1204, Ottawa, Ontario, Canada K1N 7B7 Tel: (613) 562-4002 • Fax: (613) 562-0007 • e-mail: plac@piac.ca • http://www.piac.ca

PIAC

Board of Directors

Rollie Thompson Chair, Halifax

Harry Boddington Edmonton

Margaret Crowle Saskatoon

Anne Marie Dawe Yellowknite

Dick Gathercole Vancouver

Напту Сом Chelsea

Ann Hutcheson St. John's

George Iny Montreal

Cynthia Patterson Gaspé

Howard Pawley Windsor

Ian A. Stewart Ottowa

Armine Yalnizyan Toronto

Head Office

Michael Janigan **Executive Director** General Çounşel Ext. 28

Donna Brady Office Co-ordinator Ext. 21

John Lawford Research Analyst Ext. 25

Sue Lott Counsel Ext. 23

Honorary Directors William H. Hurlbert Edmonton

Andrew J. Roman Toronto

Gaylord Walkins Jakarta

April 8, 2005

Ms. Diane Rheaume Secretary General Canadian Radio-Television and Telecommunications Commission Ottawa, ON K1A 0N2

Dear Ms. Rheaume:

SECRETARIAT VIA FAX Only IM / TELECOM 5 PAGES.

APR 08 2005

Re: CRTC Industry Steering Committee - Customer Credit Information Public Interest Advocacy Centre (PIAC) Cost Claim

With the release of Commission decision 2005-15, it seems an opportune time to submit our cost claim for participation in the CISC group studying this issue and preparing the consensus report of last year. We are submitting in keeping with past practice associated with responsible and useful intervention in the CISC process by qualified participants.

Thanks you.

Yours truly

Michael Janigan Executive Director/ General Counsel

cc: Call-Net Bell Rogers Wireless **TELUS** SaskTel

PIAC FILE # 6054

Michael Janigan
Barrister & Solicitor
c/o Public Interest Advocacy Centre
1204-ONE Nicholas Street
Ottawa, ON
KIN 7B7

STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT

March 31, 2005

TO:

Public Interest Advocacy Centre

Suite 1204

ONE Nicholas Street

Ottawa, ON KIN 7B7

Re;

CRTC Industry Steering Committee - Customer Credit Information

PIAC File # 6054

For Services Rendered as Counsel in the above-noted matter.

RATE: \$230.00 per hour

TO:

Hours

17.7 Hours @ \$230.00 per hour

\$ 4,071.00

Total fees

\$ 4,071.00

GST @ 7%

\$284.97

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND OWING:

\$ 4,355.91

Michael Japigan

GST Registration Number 127842375

TraxTime report for Michael Janigan

1/29/2004

Total 0.8

out: 9:49a

6054 CRTC Call-Net

review of customer credit proposal

2/3/2004

Total 0.5

in: 4:12p out: 4:38p

6054 CRTC Call-Net

review of file with D McKendry and email

2/6/2004

Total 0.5

in: 2:46p out: 3:14p 6054 CRTC Call-Net

review of file and correspondence with Union de Consommateurs

2/18/2004

Total 0.6

in: 6:15p out: 6:49p

6054 CRTC Call-Net

receipt and review of CISC materials

2/19/2004

Total 0.8

out: 5:47p

6054 CRTC Call-Net

review file and emails with Union

2/20/2004

Total 0.3

in: 12:03p out: 12:18p

6054 CRTC Call-Net

review of memo re compliance

3/1/2004

Total 0.8

in: 4:02p out; 4:49p 6054 CRTC Call-Net

review file and prep CISC meeting

3/3/2004

in: 9:30a

Total 5.5

out: 3:00p 6054 CRTC Call-Net

attend CISC Business Process Meeting

3/4/2004

Total 1.3

out: 3:45p

6054 CRTC Call-Net

draft meeting summary and emails and conversations

3/22/2004

Total 0.4

in: 5:12p out: 5:31p 6054 CRTC Call-Net

review of minutes

4/20/2004

Total 1.1

in: 4:10p out: 5:11p

6054 CRTC Call-Net

review document and email to consumer groups

4/22/2004

Total 0.5

in: 11:21a out: 11:46a

6054 CRTC Call-Net

review file speak with Greg Van Koughnett

4/23/2004

Total 2

PIAC

in: 9:00a out: 10:56a 6054 CRTC Call-Net

teleconference and review file consensus report

5/14/2004

Total 0.4

in: 3:56p out: 4:15p 6054 CRTC Call-Net review file consensus report

5/20/2004

Total 0.3

in: 4:01p out: 4:19p 6054 CRTC Call-Net

review file and email

6/8/2004

Total 0.5

in: 4:45p out: 5:14p 6054 CRTC Call-Net review of final report

7/7/2004 Total 0.5

in: 3:32p out: 3:59p 6054 CRTC Call-Net review of CRTC letter and file

3/30/2005 Total 0.9

in: 2:04p out: 2:54p 6054 CRTC Call-Net prep cost claim and account

4/6/2005

Total 0

The Total Of Each Project Since First Recorded Until Now

6054 CRTC Call-Net:

17.7

Total:

17.7

rd ssion

_			
Cost	Order	No.:	

FORM I -	SUMMARY	OF I	LEGAL	FEES
----------	---------	------	-------	-------------

Applicant: PIAC	Claiman	: M	CHREL J	MNIGAN	
Is the Claimant an in-house employee of the					
Legal Legal Fi	ling Student I Assistant Pate when qualified a I Counsel Or legal counsel that Completed years o Year of Call to the Has the lawyer pro-	s a law cleare not in- of practice: Bar: 178 actised con	nouse: 23 5 tinually since	Call to the Bar? Yes.	
SERVICE	(Use qu	TIME CLA	IMED	FEE CLAIMED (days or hours x rate)	
PREPARATION:	DAY	n-house se			
Review file	DA	/S QR	HOURS	1/201 00	
Prepare interrogatories			17:1	7,0.77.	
Respond to interrogatories			*****		
Prepare comments			·		
Prepare evidence		·····		- -	
Prepare for hearing			· . · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
Prepare argument					
Consult with client		<u> </u>	-van-		
Case management ·					
Other (specify):					
1.				 	
2.					
3.	,		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	<u> </u>	
ATTENDANCE:				<u> </u>	
Attend hearing					
Other (specify):	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				
1.			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	1	
2.		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
PROCEDURAL:		".		<u></u>	
Costs Application			··		
Taxation Application					
Other (specify):	·				
1.					
2. 3.					
3.			·		
TOTAL TIME CLAIMED	DAY	'S;	HOURS: _/7.7		
TOTAL FEES: 4,071,00			<u> </u>	\$ 4.071.00	
Add TAXES (GST @ 7%; PST @	%;HST @ %)			\$ 284.97	
Less TAX REBATE if applicable (Specify type and %: 50% GS	E REBATE TO	PE	<u>e</u>	\$ 142.48	
TOTAL CLAIM:				\$4,213.48	
I manaditional and a second and a second					

I certify that the above information is true and accurate.

Date: Manual 3/65 Signature of Claimant:

emnihia

Canadä

CRTC 49F (1999_05)