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Apartment Vacancies Increase In
Edmonton
Apartment vacancies across Metro Edmonton have increased this year, largely
in response to rising rental unit construction levels.  According to results
released today from Canada Mortgage and Housing Corporation’s (CMHC)
annual Rental Market Survey, the apartment vacancy rate in Edmonton
increased to 1.7 per cent in October from 0.9 per cent in October 2001.
CMHC’s survey counted 1,090 vacant apartment units across the Capital
Region, up from 576 in 2001. 

Rental apartment construction across the region has been very strong this
year, continuing a trend that began in 2001. At the same time, low mortgage
rates and rising rental costs have also driven many renters into home owner-
ship. Additional rental supply has come from two other sources:
non-residential buildings such as office space or warehouses that have been
converted to rental apartments and also condominiums (both newly-
constructed and those converted from non-residential buildings) that have
been purchased by investors and then injected into the rental stock. 

Bachelor and one-bedroom units experienced the largest increases in
vacancies, both up by 0.9 percentage points. Edmonton City’s Downtown and
West end experienced the biggest rise in vacancies while vacancy rates fell in
East Central (Zone 8). 

Despite the increased competition from newly-completed apartments, rent
levels continued to rise briskly, although the pace was off from last year.  On
the heals of a 9.8 per cent increase in the previous survey, rents for
one-bedroom units rose by 7.1 per cent to $575. Two- bedroom apartment
rents increased by 8.4 per cent to $709, for a typical gain of $55/month. This
compares with a $53/month rise in last year’s survey.  Higher renovation activ-
ity and rising operating costs also contributed to this year’s rent increases.

CMHC conducts the Rental Market Survey annually in October in all census
metropolitan areas and urban centres of 10,000 population or over.  To get a
more complete picture of the local rental market including sub-market detail
and a discussion of emerging trends, subscribe to CMHC's annual Edmonton  
Rental Market Survey Report by calling 1-877-722-CMHC.

  Canada Mortgage and Housing Corporation           

Note: Data are on 2001 census area definitions
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Edmonton Rental Market Report

Edmonton Rental Market Supplementary Tables
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