

# July 2004 Farm Survey Quebec, Ontario and British Columbia (Non-Peace)

	EQP HKF GP VKCN'\$ j gp 'kqo r rgvgf Vj kı" uwtxg{" kı" eqpf wevgf" wpf gt" yi g cwij qtk4"qh" ig "Uvckkrikeu" Cev."T gxkugf Uvcwwgu" qh" Ecpcf c." 3; : 7." e0' U'3; 0 Eqo r rgxlqp" qh" yi kı" s wgrnklppck g" kı" c rgi cri' tgs wktgo gpv" wpf gt" yi g" Uvckrikeu Cex0'
\@\Aj\` ][•^Aj\-Ac@n\A\` ç^^\An\Aj\An\Aj\An\Aj\A\\A\\An\A\\A\	@ [
Review the information on the label. If any information is incorrect or missing corrections in the boxes below.	g, please make the necessary
ØÜT	(Œ^æ#Ô[ å^
DCAF  DC   Yazi ^Aj   Alocae   a Ano asi Ano a	Ë
QCÖÜ   Λ̈́UĒ   Ο[ cĀσ[ Ē   Þ ˇ { à^! Ása] å Âld ^ / δ	
Ó[ cáρ[ È     Þˇ { à^ l haa} å ÂŪ d^ /       Ú[• caaḥÔ[ å^     Ú[• cál –æλ ÁÇ æ ^ A, -ksac Étá] } A, l haa] æ ^ A, (cal extra frequency)	
ÒTŠ	
DOEÁH	
DOEÁ	
ÔUÜ	1,14,

Í ÉÍ F€€ÉÍ HFTÈFIÁÁG€€I ÉGHÉFÏ ÚVÔÐOZÕÜËÍ Í €ÉÍ H



Statistics Statistique Canada Canada



**3** 

	ËX	GÆ							
G97H€B <sup>-</sup> 5	; F5-BG =	-B'GHCF5	5; 9						
	The following questions refer to grains in storage	ge on your fa	arm on July 31	, 2004.					
• Include:	<ul> <li>grains harvested in or prior to 2003;</li> <li>grains purchased for animal feed or seed that are not brand name;</li> <li>grains owned by someone else but stored on this farm.</li> </ul>		brand name p were purchas local feed sto grains owned off this farm farm, storage	sed (i.e. tore); I by the (e.g. ele	feed pu operato vator,	urchas or but anoth	sed fr store	rom a	1
forage should	Oats, Barley and Corn (Fodder Corn) are often had not be included as "grains in storage". If the cro	op was not h							
forage should green to feed  1. Did you  ÿ^• []:	In not be included as "grains in storage". If the cro the animals, do not record this as "grains in storage or will you have any grains in storage on y	op was not h rage". your farm o xôvo∪⊳ <i>k</i> ûeb	on July 31, 200	04?	the cro	op wa	as har	rvesto	ed
forage should green to feed  1. Did you  ÿ^• []:	In not be included as "grains in storage". If the cro the animals, do not record this as "grains in storage or will you have any grains in storage on y	op was not h rage". your farm o xôvo∪⊳ <i>k</i> ûeb	on July 31, 200	04?	the cru	July	31, 2	2004.	ed
forage should green to feed  1. Did you  ÿ^• []:	In not be included as "grains in storage". If the crop the animals, do not record this as "grains in storage on y included animals, do not record this as "grains in storage on y included animals. It is the animals, do not record this as "grains in storage on y included animals. It is the animals in storage on y included animals. It is the animals in storage. If the crop the animals is the animals in storage. If the crop the animals is the animals in storage. If the crop the animals is the animals in storage. If the crop the animals is the animals in storage. If the crop the animals is the animals in storage. If the crop the animals is the animals in storage. If the crop the animals is the animals in storage in storage in storage. If the crop the animals is the animals in storage i	op was not h rage". your farm o XXVONÞÆXED e quantity in	on July 31, 200	04?	Un Un	July	31, 2	2004.	ed
forage should green to feed  1. Did you  Ÿ^•  2. In the t	Hot be included as "grains in storage". If the crop the animals, do not record this as "grains in storage on y will you have any grains in storage on y the last the	op was not h rage". your farm o አዕላመ Þ AOED e quantity in	on July 31, 200	04?	Un it it	July lit of me	31, 2	2004.	ed

0	0-4-	Code Quantity in storage			Un	it of m	easur	е	
Сгор	Code			mt	it	kg	lb	cwt	Other
Ándi Óani/^	í€J		F	G	• н	ı	í	î	•
ÁaiÈ Ôaa) [ aan∮¦ÁÜaa]^•^^áÁ	(F)		F	G	• н	• I	í	î	•
ÁRÈÔ[1}Á[1ÁÖ[æā]ÁG]8["á^Á^^àÁ^à[K]]}ÁSTOÁRES["à^Á, ^^óKE["]D	( Vipi)		F	G	Н	• 1	í	î	•
Á		hat is the percent morage?	oistur	e cont	ent of	the Co			in
Á V	\ (ca\u00e4\	:`a^&Á^•][}â^}dÊ*[/ ¢oÁ&¦[]ÈÄGÁs@áÁááÁs@	Ág ÁÛ`^ Ápæo (Á&¦	•cā[}Ái []ÊŘ[Á	ÈÁÓ •^[ a[ÁÙ^&d	ÉAT[Áq[ a≨[}ÁÓÈÈ	JÌ H		
ÁBÈT ÃNÀ ÁŌ (20) • ÁÇ [Á !Á [!^Á ! 20] • Á[, ]Á(*^o@ !D	ÍFH	•	F	G	• н	• 1	í	î	•
ÀÈ Uæ	í€Ì		F	G	• н	ı	í	î	•
ÀÈ Ü^^AQÛ] tậ * Ásej àĐ t ÁzeijlD	ĺÌG	•	F	G	• н	·	ĺ	î	•
ÆĖÙ[^à^æ)•	ĺĠ	•	F	G	Н	·	ĺ	î	•
ÁqĒ ÚJ¦āj*Ár @aœ	Í€H	•	F	G	Н	·	ĺ	î	•
	ÇQÁÛ*/ ãrÁs@e/	^à^&Á,^•][}â^}dÉ([ ∮æ•o%s[]É([Á(AÙ^&c	Ág ÁÛ°/ Æg}ÁÓÈC	∖∙cā[}Ái )	. <b>ÈÁI</b> O •^	ĒĀ [ÁĄ	Ás@-Á;^	¢o⁄&[]	ÈÁIQÁ¢@a
Án≟ Yậ¢\Áv@eae	í€î	•	F	G	• н	·	ĺ	î	•
A	ÇQÁÛ~	^à^&Á.^•][}å^}dÊ*[	Áq ÁÛ*/	\•cā[}Â	. <b>EXIO</b>  •^	É* [Áq	ÁÙ^&cā[	}ÁÓÈD	
COUAUA COVOUD OF									

## EI 9697

Quebec respondents only

- 4. What percentage of your Corn for Grain in storage is intended for the commercial market?
- 5. What percentage of your Spring Wheat in storage is intended for human consumption?
- 6. What percentage of your Winter Wheat in storage is intended for human consumption?

ÇÕUÁ/UÁ/PÒÁÞÒÝVÁÔÜUÚÐÁMZÁ/PÒJÁÐÁPÒÄSŒÙVÁÔÜUÚÐÁÖUÁ/UÁJÒÔVQJÞÁÓÐ

Code	%
J€€	•
JÏ G	•
î€î	•

 $H\Y'Zc\c$ ck ]b[ 'ei Ygh]cbg'XYU'k ]h\ '5@@5B8'CD9F5H98'

#### Include: Land rented from other operations, • Exclude: -Land rented to other operations, cropland, woodland, wasteland, community pastures, co-operative pasture land and crown or public land grazing associations or grazing used for agricultural purposes. reserves. G97H€B<sup>.</sup>6 : 5@FM9.5B8.K =BH9F.K < 95H Did you seed any Fall Rye or Winter Wheat in the fall of 2003? €JÍ ÄÄÄ⊳ſ ÇÕUÁ/UÁ)ÒÔVQUÞÁÔÈD Which crop(s) did you seed? ÁØæHÁÜ^^ ÇŨUÁ/UÁ/PÒÁÞÒÝVÁÛWÒÙVQJÞÈ In the table below, indicate the area seeded and the area harvested or to be harvested as grain. Also indicate the yield or total production you obtained or will obtain ÁÁÁ **UOM (1 to 19)** UOM Harvested Seeded Average Crop Code (see bottom of Code Çode area area Yield ac ha arp page) æÈØæ∥ÁÜ^^ FFG ΪFG HFG 2 3 àÈYajo^¦ÁY@^æc F€Î ÇQÁÛ "^à^&Á^•][}å^}dÊX[Á[Á[ÁÛ "^•cā[}ÁIÈÁÖ|•^ÊX[Á[ÁU ÁÛ^&cā[}ÁÖÞÒ & Total harvested area (sum of 3a to 3b) ÇŰUÁUÁÙÒÔVQUÞÁÔÈD EI 9697 Quebec respondents only Code What percentage of your harvested Winter Wheat آل€ as grain is intended for human consumption? QÕUÁVUÄÙÒÔVQUÞÁÔÈD **UNIT OF MEASURE (UOM)** AREA YIELD TOTAL PRODUCTION Ó • @|• Sā[\*læ{ • T^da& Q ] ^¦ãæ Ú[ ັ} å• P } å ! ^ å FJÁÄFÁÇFJD ÓW ÇÓWD. ÇSÕD V[}}^•ÁQTVI V[] • ÁCOVD ÇŠÓD ^atóoÁqôY∨ TVFJÆÄGÁÇŒFD ŒĴÜÒÙ ÚÓÜŒD F ĺ î G Н I FJÁÄÐÁÁÇGGD Ø PÒÔVŒÜÒÜ PÒÔVŒÜÒ Ϊ Ì J F€ FF FG SÕ FJÁÄÁ ÁÇG€D ŠÓ FJÁÄÁ ÁÇCHD ΆÚÒÞVÙ FΗ FΙ Fĺ FÎ FΪ ΆÚÒÞVÙ FJÁEÁÁQEID ÔY V

G97HCB:7 G99898	.5F9	95ž<5F	J 9G	H98	:5F	95	5B8 M9@	8		
1. Did you seed any crops in 2004?										
ÿ∧• JÎ J Å Á iide jî	•	Á ÇÕUÁ VUÁ ÙÒ	d ( <b>D</b> VÔ	ÄÖÈD						
<b>↓</b>										
2. In the table below, indicate the area	seede	d and the	are	a har	vest	ed o	r to be harve	sted	(as grain).	Also
indicate the yield or total production	you c	obtained (	or wi	II OD	tain.					
	1		1	UOM		ı	L	1	1	ı
Сгор	Code	Seeded area	ac	ha	arp	Code	Harvested/ Harvested as grain area	Code	Average Yield	UOM 1 to 19 (see bottom of page)
/kmacE Ócasip ^ Aliga 84° å^ Àv 7aj cv; kiÓcasip ^ Ás ^^ å^ à Asiga Asiga Asiga Asiga Asiga Asiga (Asiga Asiga As	ŒJ	•	F	G	Н	ل€ آ	• grain area	H€J	•	• page)
\(\hat{\text{le}} \) \(\hat{\text{a}} \) \(\h		•					•	+	•	
© Acel A ACEC D	ŒÍ		F	G	Н	ΪFĺ		HFÍ		
/\$\$ÊÔ[ }Á[ ÁÖ æ#jÁQj8 °å^Án^^å/\$[ }Ás`oÁn¢& °å^Án,^^oÁs[ }D	ŒÎ		F	Ğ	"Н	ΪFÎ	,	HFÎ		
	3. WI	natisthe percei ¢oÁ&¦[]ÈÁAQÀs@aÁa.	ntmois ‱Aæe	turecon Á&[]ÉA[	itent?Æ ÆįÆÙ^&	ÇO[AÇIA© ca[}AÖÈD	PA FÈEÁQÁ.1€ÈEÃ	JÌÏ		• 🗸
ÁaÈTã¢^âÁŐ¦æá∮•Áūç, [Á;Á; [¦^Á¦æá∮•Á:[, }Áa[*^o@^¦D	ÁGFH	•	F	G	• н	ÁΓΗ	•	ÁFN		•
ÁÈ Uær	G€Ì	•	F	G	• н	ï€Ì	• ((	Hej		•
ÁÈÙ]¦ạ*ÁÜ^^	Œ€	•	• F	G	• н	ΪF€	•	Hr€	•	•
	+	•			•			+	•	•
在	ϓ		F	G	ÁH	î d <	,(\)	HGÌ		
Á@ÉÙ]¦ā)*ÁV@easc	G€H		F	G	ÄH	(±)	A Law Malace	H€H	11.66.6.6.6.0.7.6	âh
Á	ÇaA∪°^	a^&A^•][}a^}d±	₹[Æ[ÆU	^*CQ 1/A	LEADIN VE	A A AG	PA, ↑¢o4&i[] EMQAb@a Aa A	©© AjæeroRi	i[]E4T[AqtAU^&caşl}A	ОЮ
ÁnÉ Uc@ ¦ÁOM  âÁÔ  []•	ϒ	•	Á	AB )	PHÀ					
AÉ Total seeded area (sum of 2a to 2i)		•		A MANGAN	жiji i	Á				
			1//	) ~	<u> </u>	J				
ÇÃUÁUÁÙÒÔVQUÞÄÖÈÐ										
	_<		$\checkmark$							
	$\langle \langle \rangle$	$\backslash \backslash \backslash$								
		`								
$\langle \langle \langle \langle \rangle \rangle \rangle$	))`									
		ELOC	07							
		EI 96	97							
Quebec respondents only										_
4. What percentage of your harvested S	Snrine	. Wheat is	inte	nder	4			de	%	4
for human consumption?	print	, wileat is	, ,,,,,,	iiuc	4			€H		╛
Ý VÁVUÁ/PÒÁÞ Ở Ý VÁÐÜ U Ú BÁKBÁ/P QÚÁDÍÁ/PÒÁSQEÍVÁÐÜ L	JUEOUA	/UAUOOVQUÞA	DED							
	UNIT	OF MEAS	SURI	E (UC	OM)					
AREA	YIEL			•			то	TAL P	RODUCTION	
Ó • @   • Sā[ *  æ[ • T ^ d ā&	Q]^			P*}:			ÓV	V	FJÆÆFÁÇFJ[	)
ÇÓWD ÇSÕD V[}}^•ÁÇTV[	V[ }•/				ÍÇÔY V		T\	/	FJ <i>Ä</i> EÁÇŒFE	)
F ŒÔÜÒÙ F G H	I	ĺ	$\perp$	Î		CE	ÔÜÒÙ ay	_	FJÁÐÁHÁÇGGI	
G PÒÔVŒÜÒÙ Ï Ì J	F€	E FI	=	F	G	PÒĈ	ovođuću sć šć	_	FJÁÄÁÁÇG€I FJÁÄÁÁÇGHI	
Η ΟΕΰÚΟὸ⊳∨ὺ ΓΗ ΓΙ ΓΊ	FÎ	Fİ		F	ì	Ά	ÚÒÞVÙ ÔY		FJÁZÁ ÁÇGID	
						1	1 -		3	

Í ÉÍ F€€ÉÍ HFÈF

97HCB <sup>-</sup> 8 H5	5A 9'< 5M5B8': C	F5; 9 <sup>-</sup> G998							
Alfalfa and Alfalfa mixtures	h foir 11861	#	60 x 100 1 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2						
(1) 8  °å^K (C.F. <del>a) ash</del> ) åh (C.F. <del>a) ash</del> (ãr^å Å, ãr@skætārcār - ^• & ^£ā [ °åæ) Ē [   * @ { hæ) å Å, @ æc	*¦æ••ÉÅ		•						
Ò¢s ˈā^K CЩÁ[ˈæ^Æs[]Ásb^æd@esç^•ơáÁ[·Ás[Æs^Á@esç^•ơáÁ[·Ás[{{^\&@eb^^^áÁ; '}][•^•Éss[]•Á@esç^•ơáÁ[·Ás@es∱]\$ Á à^Á@esç^•ơáÁ!^^}ÁsÆsó-ÁsÁsÁ•^áÁsÁ•àÁsþā[æp-ÁsþáÁ]á^¦Ё^^à^áÁsó-æs.									
Dother Tame Hay Qs& *å^K Xæða"ca*•Á;-Ás [ç^ Ést^-[ājÉss]:[{^*: æ•Éssa][c@És, s@eså*: æ•Éssa]æ^*: æ•És^^*; æ•És^^*; æ•És^* & ^És,[*åæ]É:[;*@{Ása)å									
, @ act lae∙È Ò¢&lĭå^K OE <del>, ad adad</del> å,AOE <del>, ad ad</del> √(ā¢c'¦∧•Ê\$ad Á[lad/	^Á&'[]Áse}^æÁ@edç^•¢^åÁ;¦Áq[Á	Śa^Á@ed-ç^•σ^åÁ[¦Á&[{{^\&&ã	opÁn^^åÁn`¦][•^•Ása)åÁ&¦[]•						
@esç^∙orâA;¦ÁsœenAjājÁs^A@esç^•orâA;!^^}ÁnţÆs^A.•^áÁnţAr^âÁnejāta+eÈ DiForage Seed									
Q& `å^K Q  Á ;æ'^& ;]Á=b'^æ#@==\$ç^•o*åÁ;;Á;Á; & [ç^:路b*/-{ā菇}=[(^*;æ•-ɓa;[o@:b* Ò¢& `å^K Ø ;æ*^& ;]•Á@==\$ç^•o*åÁ;;Á;Ás,Áœ==;	[¦&@æ¦å*¦æ•É&æ)æ¦^*¦æ•É	ĺx^^*¦æ••ÊÁγ•&∵^ÊÁ•[ˇåæ) Ё•[							
. Are you growing any Tame Hay or Forage Seed in 2004?									
ÿ∧• G€€ • ÁÞ Þ G€	€ OUÁUÁUÁÚÓÔVQJÞA	CÁC							
, —	şserrer <b>c</b> ect <b>2</b>	02	$\langle \langle \rangle \rangle$						
. Which crop(s) do you have?									
● CE[-ad-ad/ad) å/ACE[-ad-ac	■ Uc@\ÁVæ{^ÁPæê	● Ø[¦æŧ	^ÁV^^å						
{ ã¢C ¦^• ©UÁUÁVVÒÙVØJÞÁHÈ	 ŒUÁUÁÛWÒÙVŒÞÁLÈ	— <u>—</u> Ď (ÕIIÁ/II	ÁÛWÒÙVŒHÞÁÍĒD						
	3-21-21-21-20-1-20-PML	A CONTRACTOR OF THE PARTY OF TH	\ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \						
	a Ea E EDO EA FA	5:A LIII (COC)	<u> </u>						
	2 5@ 5 5B8 5@ 5@	$\Delta$	÷-						
. What is your total area of Alfalfa an	nd Alfalfa mixtures? (	D¢&(* a*^A;)\a*^\\\\\\\a*\a*\a*\a*\a*\a*\a*\a*\a*\a*\a*\	e ED						
Crop	Code	Total area	UOM						
O <del>[a) aós)</del> åÁO <del>[a) aó</del> ã¢č¦∧•	gJ 97/	1	ac ha arp						
~ (C	CHk 9F 'H5A 9'	< 5 M							
. What is your total area of all Other	Tame Hay? Çò¢&ĭå^Áː	}å^¦Ë•^^å^åÁæ∳^æ∙ÈD							
Crop	Code	Total area	UOM						
Uœ¦Á/æţ^ÁPæî	gíî •		ac ha arp						
	~								
ΦυΑνυΑνΡὸλο ΘΎνΑΘΡυὺὸ ΑΘϋυὐΕλΑΦΑΝΡΟΝΑΦΙΑΘΑΝΡΟΝΑΦΙΑΘΑΝΡΟΝΟΝΡΟΝΟ	ÒÆŒÙVÁÔÜUÚÉÆÕUÁVUÁÛWÒÙV	/QJÞÁÌÈD							
	677 6 77	20							
	: CF5; 9'G99								
What is your total area of Forage S	eed? Ø¢& `å^Á}å^¦Ë^/	^ă^åÆe∳^æeÉD							
Crop	Code	Total area	UOM						
Ø ¦æ*^ÁĴ^^å	gΪ		ac ha arp						
	<u> </u>								
ΦŪ LÁ/UÁ/PÒÁÞÒÝ VÁÛWÒÙ VΦIÞÈ									
	. •		UOM						
ÎÈV[ca+pÁ/æ(^ÁPæêÁæ)åÁx0[¦æ*^Áù)^^åÁæ;^ Çi`{ÁjÄÖHÁ(ÁÖÍD	^æ∙A		• • •						
3 (1, 1, 2, 14, 10, 2			ac ha arp						
ÇÕUÁ/UÁÜÒÔVQJÞÁÒÈÒ									

$\sim$	7	Т	7	j	
G9		==		к	•
uυ	٧.		v	L	J

## @5B8<sup>.</sup>65@5B79

•	Improved Land	for	pasture	or	grazing

CE[Áæ) àÁ, @B&@\$m Áà^3, \*Á•^àÁ¦Á¦æ;ōč¦^Á¦Á¦æ;ā,\*Áæ) àÁæ) àÁ; @B&@A@æ•Á\å^!\*[}^Ás[{^Ás[];[ç^{^}};•Æ,∮Á^&^};•Á;Aé\å;æ;ā,\*Á;Áæ];ēÁ°,aæ;ā;ÈÁ^à;æ;ā;ÈÁ^à;ā,\*Á;Áæ;\*•Øæ) àÁ, ^^àÆ(}d[È

ËÁQE^æ Ág Áà^Á@æ¢ç^• c^å Ásæ Áå¦^Á@æê ÉÁ ājæt ^Á;¦Ág¦æt ^Á•^^åL

 $\vec{E}\hat{O}[~\{~\{~\ `\}~ \vec{ac}~A, \vec{ae}~\vec{c}~|~ \land \vec{E}SS[~\vec{t}~]~ \land |\vec{ae}\vec{ac}~A~ |\vec{ae}~\vec{a}~ * \vec{Ae} \bullet [~S \vec{ae}\vec{e}\vec{a}~]~ \land (A \mid \vec{ae}~\vec{a}~ * \vec{A} \land \bullet \land |\vec{c}~ \bullet~\vec{c}~]~$ 

 $Q\hat{s}_{a}\hat{A}^{a}\hat{A}^{b}\hat{A}^{b}\hat{A}^{c}\hat{A$ 

#### Unimproved Land for pasture or grazing:

Þæðāç^Á,¦Ár¦æð;\*Á,æ°č¦^Éð,æðāç^Á@êÉÁæ;\*^|æ)åÉA;ææà|^Áa\*•@Á•^åÁ;¦Áo@Ár¦æð;\*Á;¦Á^^åð;\*Á;Áãç^•₫&\È

#### Other Land:

EACE^adi -Áad{ • c^anni kÁad{ Án` alia a \* • ÉAad{ ^ ad a ÉAQ} { ^ Át ad a ^} Ánd a Án anni - L

| Maliforn Aras| \* Crankles| (An apa) \* Elese| 230 at [4] (^A/25) at [4] (An apa) Ang a Ang ase L
| Maliforn Aras| \* Crankles| (An apa) \* Elese| 230 at [4] (An apa) Ang a A

### What is your total area of Improved Land for pasture or grazing Unimproved Land for pasture or grazing and Other Land in 2004?

Á Land Use	2   \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \	UOM				
Ä Land Use	Code Total area	ac	ha	arp		
FÈQ ]   [ç^å/Ñæ) åÁ[lÁ]æ čl^Á[lÁ læ ā]*	GGC ()	1	2	3		
ŒÙW,ą̃ ]¦[ç^å&Sæ)åÁ[¦Á;æč¦^Á;¦Á;æą̄*	CH CH	1	2	3		
HÈU@¦Ææjå	ØF	1	2	3		
ÈTotal Land Balance (sum of E1 to E3	•	1	2	3		

ÇÕUÁVUÁÙÒÔVQUÞÁØÈD

## G97HCB:

## HCH5@@5B8.5F95

## What is the Total Land Area in 2004?

Land Use	Code	Total area	UOM			
∨ Land Use	Code	i Otal alea	ac	ha	arp	
FÈV[ca4/Sa) å/kŒ^æ		•	1	2	3	
ŒÙ"{ Á; -Á,^&cā;}•ÁÓH&ÆÁÓGÆÁÖÎÆÖI	Œ	•	1	2	3	
HÈÖā-^\^} &^Áa^ç ^^} ÁØFÁa) åÁØGÁØFÉØGD GÁo@Áaā-^\^} &^Áa Ár`à•œa) cãadÉÅ [^æ•^Ár¢]  æājÁajÁs[{{^}}•È			1	2	3	

ÇÕUÁUVÀUÒÔVQUÞÁÕÈD

G97	'H€B ;	:989F5@DFCJ-B7-5@	@5; F9	9A 9B1	H'HC 'G	<5F9 <sup>-</sup> ∄: CFA 5H€B
1.	FEDERAL/PROVIN	ICIAL AGREEMENT TO SHA	RE INFO	RMATI	ON	
	ONTARIO AND BR	ITISH COLUMBIA RESIDEN	TS:			
	information with yeart. Any information The provincial min	our provincial department o ion shared with a provincial listry of agriculture must qu	f agricul ministry arantee t	ture in a of agri the conf	accorda culture i fidential	operative agreement to share nce with Section 12 of the Statistics is released in aggregate form only. lity of all shared data. Statistics provincial ministry of agriculture.
			Code	Yes	•	1
	Do you agree to sh	nare this information?	051	No	•	ÇÕUÁ/UÁÛWÒÙVQUÞÁCÈÒ
	QUEBEC RESIDEN	NTS:				<b>A</b>
		ordance with Section 11 of t				operative agreement to share Statistics Canada and l'Institut
			Code	Yes	•	
2.	Request for survey	y results	976	No	•	Ç UÂUÂÛMÛÛMÊ DÊ
			Code	т:	me	1 ( ) ~
3.	Total interview tim	ie	949	•	ille	(OÞÖÁJØÁ)WÜXÓŸD
					<	
<u></u>	MMENTS:				$\overline{\mathcal{A}}$	
-	WINIENTS.			$\overline{\wedge}$	$\leftarrow$	) )
				<del>\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\\</del>	$\rightarrow \rightarrow$	
			-(5)		<u>ノ</u>	
				<u> </u>		
			$\rightarrow$			
		$(\bigcirc)$				
	$\Diamond$	, <				
	~					
	$\mathcal{A}$	$\searrow$				
	$\nearrow$ (()) $^{\star}$					
$\langle$						
1						