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Poll No. 1 - East Wiltshire

Shall be bounded as follows commencing at the intersection of the Warren Grove Road
(Route #225) and the Warren Grove Community Limits; thence following said limits
westwardly to an extension northwardly of the Cornwall Road; thence southwardly along said
extension and the Cornwall Road to the rear line of lots fronting on Patti Lee Drive; thence
eastwardly following the said rear line of lots fronting on Patti Lee Drive to Mill Creek;
thence southwardly along said creek to the Trans Canada Highway (Route #1); thence
eastwardly along said road to the Warren Grove Road (Route #225); thence northwardly
along said road to the point of commencement.

Poll No. 2 - Chateau Estates

Shall be bounded as follows commencing at the intersection of the North River and Warren
Grove Creek; thence westwardly along said creek to the Warren Grove Road (Route #225);
thence southwardly along said road to the Trans Canada Highway (Route #1); thence
eastwardly along said highway to the North River; thence northwardly along said river to the
point of commencement. (This includes Chateau Estates Trailer Park)

Poll No. 3 - Cornwall North

Shall be bounded as follows commencing at a line of  intersection northwardly from the
intersection of the Cornwall Road and the Kingston Road (Route #235) and the north
boundary of the community of Cornwall;  thence following the said community boundary
limits west, north and south to the Trans Canada Highway (Route #1); thence eastwardly
along said highway to Mill Creek; thence northwardly along said creek to the rear line of lots
fronting on the north side of Pattie Lee Drive; thence westwardly along said line to the
Cornwall Road; thence northwardly along said road and a line of extension northwardly from
the Cornwall Road to the point of commencement.

Poll No. 4 - Cornwall East

Shall be bounded as follows commencing at the intersection of the Trans Canada Highway
(Route #1) and the York Point Road (Route #248); thence westwardly along said highway to
the Ferry Road (also Route #248); thence eastwardly along said Ferry 

Road to Eliot Park Sub-division; thence northwardly, eastwardly and southwardly following
the boundaries of Eliot Park Sub-division and Eliot River Community Limits to the Ferry
Road(Route #248); thence continuing eastwardly along said road to the York Point Road
(Route #248); thence northwardly along said road to the point of commencement.

Poll No. 5 - York Point

Shall be bounded as follows commencing at the intersection of the North River and the Trans
Canada Highway (Route #1); thence westwardly along said highway to the York Point
Road(Route #248); thence southwardly along said road to the Ferry Road; thence eastwardly
along said road and an extension thereof to the North River; thence northwardly along said
river to the point of commencement.

Poll No. 6 - Ferry Road

Shall be bounded as follows commencing where the extension of the Ferry Road meets the
North River; thence westwardly along said extension and said road to Eliot River Community
Limits; thence northwardly and westwardly along said limits to the west boundary and
southwardly following the boundaries of the Eliot Park Sub-division to the Ferry Road (Route
#248); thence westwardly along said road to the Trans Canada Highway (Route #1); thence
southwardly along said road and Meadowbank Road (Route #19) to the Cornwall Community
Limits to the West River; thence eastwardly along said river to the North River and the point
of commencement.  (This includes ByWays Trailer Park)

Poll No. 7 - Cornwall South

Shall be bounded as follows commencing at the intersection of the Meadowbank Road (Route
#19) and the Trans Canada Highway (Route #1); thence westwardly along said highway to
the Cornwall Community Limits; thence following said community limits to the Meadowbank
Road (Route #19) ; thence northwardly along said road to the point of commencement.
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